

RUNWAY 10/28 LIGHTING AND MARKING IMPROVEMENTS, SRE ACQUISITION
MOTT MUNICIPAL AIRPORT
MOTT, SOUTH DAKOTA
AIP #: 3-38-0039-018-2021
A-8102
BID TABULATION
5/7/2021

Base Bid - Schedule A					Titan Machinery, Inc. Dickinson, ND		RDO Equipment Co. Bismarck, ND		Edling Electric, Inc. Bismarck, ND		Butler Machinery Company Dickinson, ND		Gooseneck Implement Kenmare, ND	
Item #	Spec #	Item Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1	GP-105	Mobilization	1	L.S.	No Bid Schedule A		No Bid Schedule A		No Bid Schedule A		Incomplete Bid		Incomplete Bid	
2	S-100	Construction Safety Phasing Plan	1	L.S.										
3	P-101	Pavement Marking Removal	1	L.S.										
4	P-620	Pavement Markings	1	L.S.										
Total Base Bid - Schedule A														

Base Bid - Schedule B					Titan Machinery, Inc. Dickinson, ND		RDO Equipment Co. Bismarck, ND		Edling Electric, Inc. Bismarck, ND		Butler Machinery Company Dickinson, ND		Gooseneck Implement Kenmare, ND	
Item #	Spec #	Item Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1	M-100	Mobilization	1	L.S.	No Bid Schedule B		No Bid Schedule B		\$5,000	\$5,000.00	Incomplete Bid		Incomplete Bid	
2	S-100	Construction Safety Plan	1	L.S.					\$1,250	\$1,250.00				
3	L-100-5.1	Demolition, Incidental Electrical	1	L.S.					\$1,250	\$1,250.00				
4	L-108-5.1	Underground Cable, 1/C #8 5kV Cable in Conduit	100	Ft					\$5	\$500.00				
5	L-110-5.1	Trench and Backfill for Conduit	80	Ft					\$10	\$800.00				
6	L-110-5.2	1-Way 2" PVC Conduit in Trench	90	Ft					\$10	\$900.00				
7	L-115-5.1	Electrical Pullbox (L-867 Can), Complete	4	Each					\$2,500	\$10,000.00				
8	L-125-5.2	Medium Intensity Threshold Light (MIRL) Base Mount Type, Complete	4	Each					\$2,500	\$10,000.00				
Total Base Bid - Schedule B									\$29,700.00					

RUNWAY 10/28 LIGHTING AND MARKING IMPROVEMENTS, SRE ACQUISITION
MOTT MUNICIPAL AIRPORT
MOTT, SOUTH DAKOTA
AIP #: 3-38-0039-018-2021
A-8102
BID TABULATION
5/7/2021

Base Bid - Schedule C					Titan Machinery, Inc. Dickinson, ND		RDO Equipment Co. Bismarck, ND		Edling Electric, Inc. Bismarck, ND		Butler Machinery Company Dickinson, ND		Gooseneck Implement Kenmare, ND	
Item #	Spec #	Item Description	Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1	--	Articulated, 4-Wheel Drive Loader	1	Each	\$81,776.00	\$81,776.00	\$98,950.00	\$98,950.00						
Total Base Bid - Schedule C						\$81,776.00		\$98,950.00						
Alternate Bid #1C														
1	--	10' Power Angle Blade w/ Rubber Cutting Edge Compatible with new 4-Wheel Drive Loader	1	Each	\$5,200.00	\$5,200.00	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00						
Total Alternate Bid #1C						\$5,200.00		\$5,000.00						
Alternate Bid #2C														
1	--	10' Snow Pusher w/ Back Drag and Rubber Cutting Edge	1	Each	\$5,800.00	\$5,800.00	\$4,900.00	\$4,900.00						
Total Alternate Bid #2C						\$5,800.00		\$4,900.00						
Alternate Bid #3C														
1	--	8' Snow Blower	1	Each	\$13,590.00	\$13,590.00	\$9,100.00	\$9,100.00						
Total Alternate Bid #3C						\$13,590.00		\$9,100.00						
Alternate Bid #4C														
1	--	8' Power Broom	1	Each	\$8,600.00	\$8,600.00	\$6,300.00	\$6,300.00						
Total Alternate Bid #4C						\$8,600.00		\$6,300.00						
Alternate Bid #5C														
1	--	72" Mower w/ Rough Cut	1	Each	\$8,600.00	\$8,600.00	\$5,400.00	\$5,400.00						
Total Alternate Bid #5C						\$8,600.00		\$5,400.00						
Trade-In (Base Bid Schedule C Deduct)														
1	--	2003 New Holland Tractor, Blade Attachment, Sweepster Broom Attachment	1	Each	(\$52,000.00)	(\$52,000.00)	(\$49,250.00)	(\$49,250.00)						
Total Trade In (Base Bid Schedule C Deduct)						(\$52,000.00)		(\$49,250.00)						
Total Base Bid Schedule C + All Alternate Bids + Trade-In						\$71,566.00		\$80,400.00						

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE FOREGOING IS AN ACCURATE REPRESENTATION AND TABULATION OF ALL BIDS RECEIVED AND THAT THE MATHEMATICS HAVE BEEN CHECKED AND IS TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE CORRECT:

PROJECT ENGINEER: Brooke Edgan DATE: 5/10/2021