RUNWAY 13 TURNAROUND RECONSTRUCTION
MILBANK MUNICIPAL AIRPORT
MILBANK, SOUTH DAKOTA
AIP #3-46-0001-052-2024
A-8710
BID TABULATION
4/16/2025 @ 11:00 a.m.

J&J Earthworks, Inc. Webster Scale, Inc. LL & Son Excavating, Inc. Dahme Construction, Inc.
Bid Schedule A (Storm Sewer Outfall Line) Milbank, SD ‘Webster, SD Hazel, SD Aberdeen, SD
Item # Spec # Item Description Quantity | Unit | Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
1 C-105  [Mobilization 1.0|L.S. $23,000.00 $23,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $28,787.75 $28,787.75
2 S-100  [Construction Safety Phasing Plan (Phase 1) 1.0|L.S. $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $13,300.00 $13,300.00 $10,603.00 $10,603.00
3 D-701  [15" Storm Sewer Pipe 3,350|Ft $56.00 $187,600.00 $55.00]  $184,250.00 $54.90 $183,915.00 $80.30 $269,005.00
4 D-701  [15" Storm Sewer Cleanout 6|Each $2,800.00 $16,800.00 $2,250.00 $13,500.00 $2,500.00 $15,000.00 $3,770.00 $22,620.00
5 D-701  |Pipe Bedding 680.0|Ton $18.50 $12,580.00 $18.00 $12,240.00 $39.30 $26,724.00 $15.00 $10,200.00
6 D-701  [15" RCP Flared End 1|Each $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,515.00 $1,515.00 $1,774.00 $1,774.00
7 p-751  |? X3 Type B Storm Sewer Inlet w/ Type E Frame and Grate 2|Each $7,200.00 | $14,400.00 $5,000.00]  $10,000.00 $7,900.00 $15,800.00 $8,199.00 $16,398.00
and 10' x 10' Concrete Apron

8 T-905  [Seeding and Fertilizing 3.1|Acres $1,800.00 $5,580.00 $2,200.00 $6,820.00 $2,570.00 $7,967.00 $4,315.00 $13,376.50
9 T-908  [Mulching 15,004|SqYd $0.35 $5,251.40 $0.55 $8,252.20 $0.75 $11,253.00 $0.40 $6,001.60

Total Bid Schedule A $274,811.40 $284,562.20 $296,474.00 $378,765.85

Total Bid Schedule A

$274,811.40 |

$284,562.20 |

$296,474.00 |

$378,765.85 |

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE FOREGOING IS AN ACCURATE REPRESENTATION AND TABULATION OF ALL BIDS RECEIVED AND THAT THE MATHEMATICS HAVE BEEN CHECKED AND ARE TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE CORRECT:

PROJECT ENGINEER:

dl...

DATE:

4/16/2025
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RUNWAY 13 TURNAROUND RECONSTRUCTION
MILBANK MUNICIPAL AIRPORT
MILBANK, SOUTH DAKOTA
AIP #3-46-0001-052-2024
A-8710
BID TABULATION
4/16/2025 @ 11:00 a.m.

‘Webster Scale, Inc.

J&J Earthworks, Inc.

LL & Son Excavating, Inc.

Dahme Construction, Inc.

Bid Schedule B (Turnaround) ‘Webster, SD Milbank, SD Hazel, SD Aberdeen, SD
Item # Spec # Item Description Quantity | Unit | Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price
1 C-105  |Mobilization 1.0[L.S. $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00
2 C-100  |Contractor Quality Control Program 1.0|L.S. $15,500.00 $15,500.00 $37,000.00 $37,000.00 $29,000.00 $29,000.00
3 S-100  [Construction Safety Phasing Plan 1.0[L.S. $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $10,500.00 $10,500.00 $11,800.00 $11,800.00
4 P-101 | Asphalt Pavement/Base Removal (13" Nominal Depth) 1,473|SqYd $14.00 $20,622.00 $9.50 $13,993.50 $8.28 $12,196.44
5 P-152  |Unclassified Excavation 2,695[Cuyd $5.00 $13,475.00 $7.50 $20,212.50 $7.24 $19,511.80
6 P-152  |Contractor Furnished Borrow Material 1,422|CuYd $15.00 $21,330.00 $14.50 $20,619.00 $23.90 $33,985.80
7 P-154  |Subbase Course 2,107[CuYd $44.00 $92,708.00 $39.00 $82,173.00 $45.60 $96,079.20
8 P-154  |Geotextile Separator Fabric 2,716/SqYd $2.50 $6,790.00 $2.75 $7,469.00 $1.50 $4,074.00
9 P-154  |Geogrid 750{SqYd $3.00 $2,250.00 $3.75 $2,812.50 $2.30 $1,725.00
10 P-208 |Aggregate Base Course 403[CuYd $50.00 $20,150.00 $44.00 $17,732.00 $67.75 $27,303.25
11 D-701  [12" Storm Sewer Pipe 130|Ft $45.00 $5,850.00 $53.00 $6,890.00 $73.95 $9,613.50
12 D-701  |Pipe Bedding 30.0|Ton $18.00 $540.00 $22.00 $660.00 $34.15 $1,024.50 No Bid
13 D-705  |4" Perforated Underdrain Pipe 909|Ft $10.00 $9,090.00 $15.50 $14,089.50 $30.40 $27,633.60
14 D-705  |Underdrain Cleanout 4|Each $300.00 $1,200.00 $800.00 $3,200.00 $150.00 $600.00
15 D-705  |Connect Underdrain to Storm Sewer Piping 4|Each $400.00 $1,600.00 $550.00 $2,200.00 $780.00 $3,120.00
16 D751 | X3 Type B Storm Sewer Inlet w/ Type E Frame and Grate 1[Each | $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $5,600.00 $5,600.00
and 10' x 10" Concrete Apron
17 T-901  [Seeding and Fertilizing 1.8|Acre $2,200.00 $3,960.00 $1,800.00 $3,240.00 $2,570.00 $4,626.00
18 T-905 |Topsoiling (Removed from Stockpile) 738|CuYd $4.50 $3,321.00 $8.25 $6,088.50 $4.15 $3,062.70
19 T-908  |[Mulching 8,712|SqYd $0.55 $4,791.60 $0.40 $3,484.80 $0.90 $7,840.80
20 TL-100 |Field Laboratory 1|L.S. $500.00 $500.00 $1.00 $1.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
21 Plans  |Inlet Protection 3|Each $110.00 $330.00 $1.75 $5.25 $215.00 $645.00
22 Plans  |High Flow Silt Fence 635|Ft $0.55 $349.25 $4.25 $2,698.75 $6.00 $3,810.00
Total Bid Schedule B $277,356.85 $301,269.30 $336,251.59 -
Bid Schedule B1 (Turnaround Surfacing) ‘Webster Scale, Inc. J&J Earthworks, Inc. LL & Son Excavating, Inc. Dahme Construction, Inc.
Item # Spec # Item Description Quantity | Unit | Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price
1 P-403 | Asphalt Base/Surface Course 596.7| Ton $114.00 $68,023.80 $130.00 $77,571.00 $143.00 $85,328.10
2 P-403 | Asphalt Binder (PG 64-34) 41.8[Ton $805.00 $33,649.00 $1,050.00 $43,890.00 $822.00 $34,359.60
3 P-602  |Emulsified Prime Coat 3.8|Ton $2,650.00 $10,070.00 $550.00 $2,090.00 $2,675.00 $10,165.00 No Bid
4 P-603  |Emulsified Tack Coat 1.1|Ton $2,200.00 $2,420.00 $1,100.00 $1,210.00 $2,675.00 $2,942.50
5 P-620 |Pavement Markings 1.0[L.S. $7,400.00 $7,400.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $7,475.00 $7,475.00
Total Bid Schedule B1 $121,562.80 $130,261.00 $140,270.20 -
Bid Schedule B2 (Electrical) ‘Webster Scale, Inc. J&J Earthworks, Inc. LL & Son Excavating, Inc. Dahme Construction, Inc.
Item # Spec # Item Description Quantity | Unit | Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price
1 015126 |Temporary Phasing Work, Electrical 1.0[L.S. $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,530.00 $1,530.00
2 L-108 lclfngluoii 8 AWG, 5 kV, L-824, Type C Cable, Installed in 657|Ft $3.00 $1,971.00 $2.80|  $1,839.60 $3.00 $1,971.00
1/C No. 6 AWG, Solid, Bare Copper Counterpoise Wire,
3 L-108 [Installed in Trench or Plowed, Including Above Conduit, 561|Ft $7.00 $3,927.00 $3.00 $1,683.00 $7.10 $3,983.10
Connections, Terminations, & Ground Rods No Bid
4 L-110 [Remove & Dispose of Existing Cable; Conduit to Remain 96| Ft $0.55 $52.80 $1.00 $96.00 $0.55 $52.80
5 L-110 [Remove & Dispose of Existing Cable & Conduit 458|Ft $4.75 $2,175.50 $3.25 $1,488.50 $4.81 $2,202.98
6 L-110  |Remove & Dispose of Existing Junction Box 4|Each $325.00 $1,300.00 $125.00 $500.00 $327.80 $1,311.20
7 L-110  [Trenching & Backfilling or Plowing for Conduit 591 |Ft $6.60 $3,900.60 $6.70 $3,959.70 $6.83 $4,036.53
Non-Encased, Electrical Conduit, 1-2 Inch, Type I, Sch. 40 PVC
8 L-110 in Trench or SDR 13 HDPE Plowed 472|Ft $3.25 $1,534.00 $4.15 $1,958.80 $3.28 $1,548.16
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RUNWAY 13 TURNAROUND RECONSTRUCTION
MILBANK MUNICIPAL AIRPORT
MILBANK, SOUTH DAKOTA
AIP #3-46-0001-052-2024
A-8710
BID TABULATION
4/16/2025 @ 11:00 a.m.

Bid Schedule B2 (Electrical) ‘Webster Scale, Inc. J&J Earthworks, Inc. LL & Son Excavating, Inc. Dahme Construction, Inc.
Item # Spec # Item Description Quantity | Unit | Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price
9 L-110 |Sand-Encased, Electrical Conduit, 2-2 Inch, Type I1l, Sch. 80 120|Ft $25.00 $3,000.00 $28.75 $3,450.00 $25.13 $3,015.60
PVC in Trench
10 L-125 |Remove & Salvage Existing Runway Edge Light & Transformer 1|Each $110.00 $110.00 $250.00 $250.00 $109.27 $109.27
(Stake Mounted)
11 L-125 |Remove & Salvage Existing Taxiway Edge Light & 4|Each $110.00 $440.00 $250.00 $1,000.00 $109.27 $437.08
Transformer (Stake Mounted)
12 L-125 |L853, 30-Inch Type Il (Elevated), Style [ (Plowable), 15|Each $100.00 $1,500.00 $180.00 $2,700.00 $92.88 $1,393.20
Retroreflective Markers
13 L-125 |L-861T, 30-Inch Elevated, Mode 1, LED, Medium Intensity 15|Each | $1,750.00 |  $26,250.00 $1,700.00|  $25,500.00 $2,305.53 $34,582.95 No Bid

Taxiway Light (MITL), Blue, Including Base Can

L-861T Entrance/Exit Lights (2 Lights), 30-Inch Elevated,
14 L-125 |Mode 1, LED, Medium Intensity Taxiway Light (MITL), Blue, 1|Set $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $3,988.24 $3,988.24
Including Base Cans

L-858R Mandatory Airfield Sign, Size 1, Style 4 (Unlighted),

15 L125 | e 11 Module, Including Sign Pad 1{Bach | $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $4,900.00 $4,900.00 $3,715.08 $3,715.08
16 L-125 |L-858R Mandatory Airfield Sign, Size 1, Style 4 (Unlighted), 1|Bach |  $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $5,300.00 $5,300.00 $3,715.08 $3,715.08
Mode 1, 2 Module, Including Sign Pad
17 L-125 |Spare Parts 1.0[L.S. $1,825.00 $1,825.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,879.39 $1,879.39
Total Bid Schedule B2 $60,585.90 $62,725.60 $69,471.66 -
| Total Bid Schedules B, B1, B2 | $459,505.55] $494,255.90] $545,993.45] - |

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE FOREGOJNG IS AN ACCURATE REPRESENTATION AND TABULATION OF ALL BIDS RECEIVED AND THAT THE MATHEMATICS HAVE BEEN CHECKED AND ARE TO THE BEST OF MY KNOWLEDGE CORRECT:

PROJECT ENGINEER: m\/ DATE: 4/16/2025
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